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12. Status of current contracts.  Please provide the name & number of current contracts as well as a sample 
list of the projects currently underway.   

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
13. How will the Contractor be able to meet the project timeline and budget given the current workload, 

work force and equipment? 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
14. List the number of personnel that will be assigned to the project and include job titles and their licenses 

or certifications. 
 ____________________________________________________________________________________

____________________________________________________________________________________
____________________________________________________________________________________
____________________________________________________________________________________
____________________________________________________________________________________
____________________________________________________________________________________
____________________________________________________________________________________
____________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
15. Has the Contractor or any principals of the applicant organization failed to qualify as a responsible 

Contractor; refused to enter into a contract after an award has been made; failed to complete a contract 
during the past five (5) years or been declared to be in default in any contract or been assessed liquidated 
damages in the last five (5) years?  List the name of project, location, client, engineer, date and reason. 
Use additional pages if needed. 

Total Number of Projects where Failure to Complete Work Occurred: _____________ 

 

Project Number 1 

Project Name:  

Project Location: 

Client Name and Phone Number: 

Engineer Name and Phone Number: 

Date: 

Reason: 

 

0

1. Annual Utility Labor Services - Indian River County

2. Annual Utility Labor Services - City of Vero Beach

3. Continuing Services for Minor Construction Projects - City of Cocoa Beach

4. Continuing Construction Services - City of Rockledge

Through proper communication and planning done weekly by a schedule, CK will be able to accommodate

the needs of the City and be able to respond to a project in a timely manner, including

emergencies. The experience, drive and goals of the CK team ensures work is done

efficiently which in turn reduces unforeseen costs or problems.CK employs enough crews

to handle the current workload, and then some.Our experience with other municipalities

has greatly benefited the way we schedule, plan, and execute our projects to ensure a quality product.

Bobby Burns - Vice President - CUC1225211
Kirk Dermott - Superintendent
Robert Burns - Superintendent

Steve Seiter - Project Manager
Nicole Mancini - Project Manager

Nelson Bonilla - Superintendent

*See attached list for a complete list of current contracts.*









































E-Bid #20240060
E-Bid Reply Excel Spreadsheet

Citywide Stormwater & Rights of Way Preventative Maintenance and 
Repair Projects

Schedule "A" - Commonly Used Item List

Company Name: _____CK Contractors & Development_____

Installation Items - Drainage
Item 
No. Description Units Quantity  Unit Price  Amount 

1 Culvert - Corrugated Poly Pipe 24" (Air trained) LF 1,500  $               91.50  $              137,250.00 
2 Culvert - Corrugated Poly Pipe 30" (Air trained) LF 800  $            134.00  $              107,200.00 
3 Culvert - Elliptical Reinforced Concrete Pipe 12" x 18" LF 400  $               77.50  $                31,000.00 
4 Culvert - Elliptical Reinforced Concrete Pipe 14" x 23" LF 600  $               90.00  $                54,000.00 
5 Culvert - Elliptical Reinforced Concrete Pipe 19" x 30" LF 500  $            130.00  $                65,000.00 
6 Culvert - Elliptical Reinforced Concrete Pipe 24" x 38" LF 700  $            179.00  $              125,300.00 
7 Culvert - Elliptical Reinforced Concrete Pipe 29" x 45" LF 200  $            236.00  $                47,200.00 
8 Culvert - Elliptical Reinforced Concrete Pipe 34" x 53" LF 200  $            328.00  $                65,600.00 
9 Culvert - Elliptical Reinforced Concrete Pipe 38" x 60" LF 750  $            466.00  $              349,500.00 

10 Culvert - Elliptical Reinforced Concrete Pipe 43" x 68" LF 330  $            564.00  $              186,120.00 
11 Culvert - Elliptical Reinforced Concrete Pipe 48" x 76" LF 670  $            727.00  $              487,090.00 
12 Culvert - Reinforced Concrete Pipe 24" LF 400  $            114.00  $                45,600.00 
13 Culvert - Reinforced Concrete Pipe 30" LF 480  $            152.00  $                72,960.00 
14 Culvert - Reinforced Concrete Pipe 36" LF 360  $            179.00  $                64,440.00 
15 Culvert - Reinforced Concrete Pipe 42" LF 360  $            234.00  $                84,240.00 
16 Culvert - Reinforced Concrete Pipe 48" LF 360  $            279.00  $              100,440.00 
17 Dicth Bottom Inlet Type C - 8' Deep or Less EA 5  $         5,020.00  $                25,100.00 
18 Dicth Bottom Inlet Type C - More than 8' Deep EA 3  $         6,945.00  $                20,835.00 

19 Dicth Bottom Inlet Type C - 8' Deep or Less (Alt Bottom) EA 5  $         7,990.00  $                39,950.00 

20 Dicth Bottom Inlet Type C - More than 8' Deep (Alt Bottom) EA 3  $       10,400.00  $                31,200.00 
21 Ditch Bottom Inlet Type D - 8' Deep or Less EA 2  $         7,920.00  $                15,840.00 
22 Ditch Bottom Inlet Type D - More than 8' Deep EA 2  $       11,200.00  $                22,400.00 

23 Ditch Bottom Inlet Type D - 8' Deep or Less (Alt Bottom) EA 2  $       10,700.00  $                21,400.00 

24 Ditch Bottom Inlet Type D - More than 8' Deep (Alt Bottom) EA 2  $       14,400.00  $                28,800.00 
25 Ditch Bottom Inlet Type E - 8' Deep or Less EA 5  $         6,965.00  $                34,825.00 
26 Ditch Bottom Inlet Type E - More than 8' Deep EA 2  $       10,300.00  $                20,600.00 
27 Ditch Bottom Inlet Type E - 8' Deep or Less (Alt Bottom) EA 5  $         9,395.00  $                46,975.00 
28 Ditch Bottom Inlet Type E - More than 8' Deep (Alt Bottom) EA 2  $       13,000.00  $                26,000.00 
29 Endwall 24" or Equivalent - All Materials₁ EA 10  $         8,245.00  $                82,450.00 
30 Endwall 30" or Equivalent - All Materials₁ EA 15  $         9,225.00  $              138,375.00 
31 Endwall 36" or Equivalent - All Materials₁ EA 6  $       13,100.00  $                78,600.00 
32 Endwall 42" or Equivalent - All Materials₁ EA 6  $       14,900.00  $                89,400.00 
33 Endwall 48" or Equivalent - All Materials₁ EA 6  $       16,600.00  $                99,600.00 
34 Endwall 54" or Equivalent - All Materials₁ EA 8  $       20,500.00  $              164,000.00 
35 Endwall 60" or Equivalent - All Materials₁ EA 8  $       28,600.00  $              228,800.00 
36 Mitered End Section 24" or Equivalent - All Materials₂ EA 10  $         2,620.00  $                26,200.00 
37 Mitered End Section 30" or Equivalent - All Materials₂ EA 5  $         4,645.00  $                23,225.00 
38 Mitered End Section 36" or Equivalent - All Materials₂ EA 4  $         5,445.00  $                21,780.00 
39 Mitered End Section 42" or Equivalent - All Materials₂ EA 4  $         9,225.00  $                36,900.00 
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E-Bid #20240060
E-Bid Reply Excel Spreadsheet

Citywide Stormwater & Rights of Way Preventative Maintenance and 
Repair Projects

Schedule "A" - Commonly Used Item List

Company Name: _____CK Contractors & Development_____

40
Rip Rap Rubble - Includes Fabric & Bedding Stone (must meet FDOT, 
USDA, NRCS and other entity standards) - FDOT Certified TN 8,000   NO BID   NO BID 

41
Rip Rap Rubble - Includes Fabric & Bedding Stone (must meet FDOT, 
USDA, NRCS and other entity standards) - Not FDOT Certified TN 1,000   NO BID   NO BID 

42 Structure / Inlet Connection to Existing EA 11  $         1,360.00  $                14,960.00 
43 Concrete Collars - 30" or less EA 15  $         2,060.00  $                30,900.00 
44 Concrete Collars - 36" or less EA 8  $         2,855.00  $                22,840.00 
45 Miscellaneous Concrete Removal CY 250  $            129.00  $                32,250.00 
46 Optional 12" Base - #57 Stone SY 700  $               54.50  $                38,150.00 
47 Optional 12" Base - Recycled  Concrete SY 200  $               35.00  $                   7,000.00 
48 Paver Brick Driveway - Remove & Re-Install SY 90  NO BID  NO BID 
49 Structure / Inlet Modifications (per Modification) EA 50  $         1,280.00  $                64,000.00 
50 Subtotal Installation Items - Drainage  $           3,556,295.00 

 $                               -   
Installation - Roadway & Sidewalk Items  $                               -   

Item 
No. Description Units Quantity  Unit Price 

51
Furnish & Install Superpave Asphaltic Concrete SP-9.5,to be placed by 
hand, under 25 SY per location - Under 2 ton SY 650  $               82.00  $                53,300.00 

52
Furnish & Install Superpave Asphaltic Concrete SP-9.5, to be placed by 
paver over 25 SY per location - Over 2 ton SY 325  $            158.00  $                51,350.00 

53
Furnish & Install Superpave Asphaltic Concrete SP-12.5,to be placed by 
hand, under 25 SY per location - Under 2 ton SY 325  $               76.00  $                24,700.00 

54
Furnish & Install Superpave Asphaltic Concrete SP-12.5, to be placed by 
paver over 25 SY per location - Over 2 ton SY 150  $            152.00  $                22,800.00 

55 Curb - Type "D" - includes end section (per FDOT Standards) LF 500  $               35.00  $                17,500.00 

56 Curb - Type "F" - includes end section (per FDOT Standards) LF 100  $               58.50  $                   5,850.00 

57 Curb - Type "Drop Curb" - includes end section (per FDOT Standards) LF 250  $               41.00  $                10,250.00 

58
Optional Base (Coquina Rock per FDOT Standards) - 12" thick typ. - 
Optional base group 9" or 11" SY 100  $               43.50  $                   4,350.00 

59
Optional Base (Asphalt per FDOT Standards) - 6" thick typ. - Optional 
base group 9" or 11" SY 100  $            117.00  $                11,700.00 

60 Flowable Fill CY 250  $            289.00  $                72,250.00 

61
Sidewalk - 4" Thick 0-50 ft in length (per FDOT Standards)  more than 
50 ft. in length (per FDOT Standards) Includes Curb Ramps SY 600  $            119.00  $                71,400.00 

62
Sidewalk - 4" Thick 51 -100 ft in length (per FDOT Standards) more tan 
50 ft. In length (per FDOT Standards) Includes Curb Ramps SY 600  $            119.00  $                71,400.00 
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E-Bid #20240060
E-Bid Reply Excel Spreadsheet

Citywide Stormwater & Rights of Way Preventative Maintenance and 
Repair Projects

Schedule "A" - Commonly Used Item List

Company Name: _____CK Contractors & Development_____

63
Sidewalk - 4" Thick 5' to 50' not more than 50' (per FDOT Standards) 
Includes Curb Ramps SY 600  $            119.00  $                71,400.00 

64

Sidewalk - 6" Thick 0-50 ft in length (per FDOT Standards) includes 
Driveway Repair/Replacement and curb ramps more than 50 ft. in 
length (per FDOT Standards) Includes Curb Ramps SY 600  $            161.00  $                96,600.00 

65

Sidewalk - 6" Thick 5' to 50'  51 - 100 ft in length (per FDOT Standards) 
includes Driveway Repair/Replacement and curb ramps not more than 
50' (per FDOT Standards) Includes Curb Ramps SY 1,500  $            161.00  $              241,500.00 

66 Subtotal Installation - Roadway & Sidewalk Items  $              826,350.00 
Installation Items - General Site Work & Landscaping Items  $                               -   

Item 
No. Description Units Quantity  Unit Price #VALUE!
67 Embankment / Fill - Material from City Site CY 1,000  $               27.00  $                27,000.00 
68 Embankment / Fill - Material Supplied by Contractor CY 5,000  $               59.50  $              297,500.00 
69 Irrigation - Remove, Relocate & Repair LS 8  NO BID  NO BID 
70 Sod - Bahia - includes watering SY 10,000  $                 5.60  $                56,000.00 
71 Sod - Floratam - includes watering SY 4,000  $                 7.20  $                28,800.00 

72 Subtotal Installation Items - General Site Work & Landscaping Items  $              409,300.00 
 $                               -   

Removal & Disposal Items  $                               -   
Item 
No. Description Units Quantity  Unit Price #VALUE!
73 Culvert (all materials) - 30" or Less LF 300  $               19.00  $                   5,700.00 
74 Culvert (all materials) - 36" or More LF 300  $               26.00  $                   7,800.00 
75 Curb LF 500  $                 9.00  $                   4,500.00 
76 Drainage Inlets EA 25  $            586.00  $                14,650.00 
77 Endwalls - 30" or Less EA 15  $            670.00  $                10,050.00 
78 Endwalls - 36" or More EA 12  $            938.00  $                11,256.00 
79 Guardrail - End Anchorage MELT Type (per FDOT Standards) LF 120  $               27.50  $                   3,300.00 
80 Pavement & Base Material SY 1,800  $               20.00  $                36,000.00 
81 Sidewalk SY 300  $               22.50  $                   6,750.00 
82 Subtotal Removal & Disposal Items  $              100,006.00 

 $                               -   
Additional Items  $                               -   

Item 
No. Description Units Quantity  Unit Price #VALUE!
83 Mobilization / Demobilization LS 15  $         4,500.00  $                67,500.00 
84 Maintenance of Traffic - Lane Closure LS 15  $         2,500.00  $                37,500.00 
85 Maintenance of Traffic - Road Closure LS 15  $         4,000.00  $                60,000.00 
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E-Bid #20240060
E-Bid Reply Excel Spreadsheet

Citywide Stormwater & Rights of Way Preventative Maintenance and 
Repair Projects

Schedule "A" - Commonly Used Item List

Company Name: _____CK Contractors & Development_____

86 Survey Stake-Out & As-Built HR 15  $            275.00  $                   4,125.00 
87 5 Man Crew - Includes Supervisor HR 10  $            375.00  $                   3,750.00 
88 Additional Equipment Operator HR 2  $               37.50  $                        75.00 
89 Additional Laborer HR 2  $               30.00  $                        60.00 
90 Back Hoe (Rubber Tire) HR 1  $               65.00  $                        65.00 
91 Dump Truck (10 CY or More) HR 3  $               95.00  $                      285.00 
92 Front End Loader HR 2  $            135.00  $                      270.00 
93 Hydraulic Excavator (Gradall) HR 2  $            120.00  $                      240.00 
94 Hydraulic Excavator (Track Hoe) HR 3  $            145.00  $                      435.00 
95 Skid Steer Loader HR 2  $               70.00  $                      140.00 
96 Fence Removal & Relocation of Existing - Chain Link LF 200  NO BID  NO BID 
97 Fence Removal & Relocation of Existing - Wooden LF 200  NO BID  NO BID 
98 Fence Removal & Relocation of Existing - Vinyl LF 200  NO BID  NO BID 
99 Fence Removal & Replacement with New - Chain Link LF 600  NO BID  NO BID 

100 Fence Removal & Replacement with New - Wooden LF 600  NO BID  NO BID 
101 Fence Removal & Replacement with New - Vinyl LF 600  NO BID  NO BID 
102 Tree Removal & Replacement - 10" or less EA 5  NO BID  NO BID 
103 Tree Removal & Replacement - 11" or more EA 5  NO BID  NO BID 

104
Survey Stake-out & As-Builts (by licensed Surveyor when requested by 
the City for establishing property corners) HR 10  $            300.00  $                   3,000.00 

105 Excavation & Embarkment CY 10,000  $               44.00  $              440,000.00 
106 Dredging (Tidal/Non-Tidal) CY 10,000  NO BID  NO BID 
107 Refurbish Sheet Pile Weir (Sandblast & Protective Coating) SF 10,000  NO BID  NO BID 

108
Refurbish Sheet Pile Weir (Steel Plate Repair) ) Install new sheet pile 
and cap, designed by others SF 4,000  NO BID  NO BID 

109 Cleaning & Sealing Concrete Cap (Includes Siloxane Penetrant Sealer) SF 3,000  NO BID  NO BID 
110 Utility Box Adjustment EA 5  $            325.00  $                   1,625.00 
111 Subtotal Additional Items  $              619,070.00 
112 Total - Schedule A  $           5,511,021.00 

Notes:
1. Endwalls having multiple pipe runs will be multiplied by the number of pipes
2. Mitered End Sections having multiple pipe runs will be multiplied by the number of 
pipes.
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