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ITEM Manufacturer Discount Percentage Off Manufacturers Price List Discount Percentage Off Manufacturers Price List

1 ADS Drainage NO BID NO BID

2
Amiad 48.00% NO BID

3
Armor (valve boxes) 53.00% 50.00%

4
Bermad NO BID 20.00%

5
Carson (valve boxes) 56.00% 50.00%

6 CDR Systems Group NO BID NO BID

7 Colonial Plastics (PVC fittings) NO BID NO BID

8
Data Industrial NO BID 5.00%

9
Dryconn 63.00% 55.00%

10
Flomatic 55.00% NO BID

11 Freedom Plastics NO BID NO BID

12 Fresno NO BID NO BID

13
Harco (ductile fittings) 43.00% 35.00%

14
Harco (PVC fittings) 32.00% 30.00%

15 Hunter Large Turf (golf) NO BID NO BID

16
Hunter Whole Goods 60.50% 60.00%

17
Hunter Parts 58.00% 50.00%

18 Greenlee Textron NO BID NO BID

19
IPS 60.00% 60.00%

20 Intermatic NO BID NO BID

21
Irritrol Whole Goods 57.00% 55.00%

22
Irritrol Parts 50.00% 50.00%

23
Lasco (all PVC products) 50.00% NO BID

24
Lennox 20.00% 35.00%

25
3M 20.00% 20.00%

26
Matco-Norco Brass Valves 54.00% 50.00%

27
Maxijet 60.00% 50.00%

28
McCrometer NO BID 10.00%

29
NDS Valve Boxes NO BID 55.00%

30
Netafim Products 51.00% 50.00%

31
Nibco 52.00% 55.00%

32 Paige Wire Products NO BID NO BID

33
Pentair Water 52.00% 55.00%

34 Plastiweld NO BID NO BID

35
RainBird Whole Goods 55.00% 55.00%

36
RainBird Parts 42.00% 44.00%

37
Red-White Brass Valves 50.00% 50.00%

38 Regency Wire NO BID NO BID

39
Sanderson 13.00% NO BID

40
Silverline 13.00% NO BID

41
Spears (PVC Fittings) NO BID 60.00%

42
T-Christy Enterprise Red Hot Blue Glue 41.00% 40.00%

43 Toro Large Turf ( Golf) NO BID NO BID

44
Toro Whole Goods 55.00% 55.00%

45
Toro Parts 42.00% 44.00%

46 Tucor NO BID NO BID

47 Uniweld NO BID NO BID
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