BOARD OF COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS

Bid No. 20-062

Roadway Surfacing, Reconstruction, and Preservation

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

Asphalt Paving

C.W. Roberts

OHL/ Community

Pavement

Ranger

Construction

Systems Contractin Asphalt Technology, Inc. .
September 2, 2020 @ 3:00 PM Y g P - Industries, Inc.
ltem Group A-General (Required) Unit Zepyhills,FL Palm City,FL Vero Beach, FL Westlake, Ohio Ft. Pierce, FL
No. Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Mobilization
101-1A |Work Order Total $0.00-$50,000 LS $7,500.00 $5,750.00 $23,780.00 $2,000.00 $8,680.00
101-1B Work Order Total $50,000- $100,000 LS $7,500.00 $8,000.00 $26,410.00 $1,900.00 $8,680.00
101-1C Work Order Total $100,001 - $5000,000 LS $7,500.00 $17,000.00 $36,930.00 $1,800.00 $8,990.00
101-1D Work Order Total Over $500,000 LS $7,500.00 $25,000.00 $39,570.00 $1,800.00 $8,990.00
Maintenance of Traffic
Standard FDOT 600 Series MOT for Lane DA $2,500.00 $2,400.00 $1,247,340.00 $1,500.00 $3,140.00
102-1A  |Closure
Miscellaneous
104-13-1 |[Silt Fence Type llI LF $2.00 $2.50 $4.10 $14.50 $1.30
110-7-1A |Mailbox (Remove and Replace) EA $150.00 $100.00 $803.00 $300.00 $767.50
339-1 Miscellaneous Asphalt TN $325.00 $325.00 $481.00 $450.00 $479.00
570-1 Performance Turf SY $3.75 $4.50 $15.00 $9.00 $4.00
577-70A |Shoulder Rework SY $1.75 $3.50 $52.80 $48.00 $4.25
918-331 |Bituminous Patching Material CF $20.00 $20.00 $588.00 $48.00 $432.50
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ADA Standards

Asphalt Paving Systems

C.W. Roberts Contracting

OHL/ Community Asphalt

Pavement 1echnology,

lng

Ranger Construction
lndustries lng

Concrete Curb & Gutter, Variable Heightr, Type

LF

$43.48

$40.00

$65.20

$38.00

$24.70

520-1-11 |F
522-2 Concrete Sidewalk & Driveways, 6" SY $71.80 $60.00 $105.00 $78.00 $54.30
527-2 Detectable Warnings SF $32.15 $50.00 $58.80 $44.00 $46.75
Painted Pavement Markings
710-11-121 |Standard, White, Solid 6" LF $0.37 $0.30 $0.30 $0.49 $0.40
710-11-122 |Standard White, Solid 8" LF $0.50 $0.40 $1.10 $0.63 $0.50
710-11-123 |Standard White, Solid12" LF $1.25 $0.70 $2.40 $1.05 $0.90
710-11-124 |Standard White, Solid 18" LF $2.00 $1.20 $2.50 $1.40 $1.15
710-11-125 |Stamdard White, Solid 24" LF $2.50 $1.60 $2.70 $1.82 $1.50
Item Description
710-11-131 |Standard White Skip 6" LF $0.50 $0.30 $0.80 $0.49 $0.40
710-11-141 Standard White, Dotted/ guildline 6-10 Gap,6" LF $0.50 $0.20 $0.85 $0.49 $0.40
710-11-16 |Standard White Message EA $70.00 $95.00 $79.50 $91.00 $76.00
710-11-17 |Standard, White, Arrows EA $35.00 $35.00 $63.60 $42.00 $35.05
710-11-18 |Standard, White, Yield Line LF $5.00 $3.75 $15.90 $2.80 $2.35
710-11-221 |Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" LF $0.37 $0.30 $0.80 $0.49 $0.40
710-11-222 |Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF $0.50 $0.40 $1.10 $0.63 $0.50
710-11-223 |Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF $1.25 $0.70 $2.40 $0.28 $0.90
710-11-224 |Standard Yellow, Solid 18" LF $2.00 $1.20 $2.50 $1.40 $1.15
710-11-225 |Standard, Yellow, Soild 24" LF $2.50 $1.60 $2.70 $1.82 $1.50
710-11-231 |Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" LF $0.50 $0.20 $0.80 $0.49 $0.40
710-11-241 Standard, Yellow, Dotted/ Guildline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF $0.50 $0.20 $0.85 $0.49 $0.40
ltem GROUP B- Resurfacing/ Reconstruction
Milling O to 2,500 Square Yards
327-70-1A |1" Average Depth SY $5.15 $3.75 $8.20 No Bid $6.75
327-70-5A |2' Average Depth SY $5.15 $4.50 $8.90 No Bid $7.40
327-70-4A [Variable Depths over 2" SY $5.20 $5.00 $9.70 No Bid $8.05

Milling 2,501 to 10,000 Square Yerds




327-70-1B |1" Average Depth SY $2.15 $2.25 $4.50 No Bid $2.45
327-70-58 |2" Average Depth SY $2.15 $2.75 $6.50 No Bid $3.15
327-70-4B |Variable Depths over 2" SY $2.20 $3.50 $8.70 No Bid $4.70
Milling 10,001 to 20,000 Square Yerds
327-70-1C |1" Average Depth SY $2.15 $2.25 $4.30 No Bid $1.55
327-70-5C [2" Average Depth SY $2.15 $2.75 $6.10 No Bid $2.20
327-10-4C |Variable Depths over 2" SY $2.20 $3.50 $7.50 No Bid $3.80
Milling over 20,001 Square Yerds
327-70-1D |1" Average Depth SY $2.15 $2.25 $4.00 No Bid $1.75
327-10-5D |2" Average Depth SY $2.15 $2.75 $5.70 No Bid $2.50
327-10-4D |Variable Depths over 2" SY $2.20 $3.50 $6.70 No Bid $4.25
Asphalt Types from 2,501 to 10,000 Square Yards
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) .
334-1-131A |17 SY $8.25 $8.25 $17.20 No Bid $10.05
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) .
334-1-133A |2~ SY $16.50 $16.50 $24.00 No Bid $15.95
SIEJperpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) sy $13.00 $13.00 $22.20 No Bid $14.10
334-1-134A |2
Asphalt Types from 0 to 2,500 Square Yards
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) .
334-1-131B |1 SY $7.00 $7.00 $10.50 No Bid $7.55
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) ,
334-1-133B |2 SY $14.00 $14.00 $19.20 No Bid $12.90
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP .
334-1-134B |12.5) 2" SY $12.00 $12.00 $16.90 No Bid $12.20
Asphalt Types from 10,001 to 20,000 Square Yards
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) .
334-1-131C |1~ SY $6.75 $6.75 $9.60 No Bid $6.35
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) .
334-1-133C | SY $13.50 $13.50 $18.30 No Bid $12.85
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP .
334-1-134C |12.5) 2° SY $12.00 $12.00 $17.20 No Bid $12.20

Asphalt Types from over 20,001 Square Yards




Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5)

334-1-131D |1~ SY $6.60 $6.60 $9.80 No Bid $6.40
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) :
334-1-133D | SY $13.20 $13.20 $17.70 No Bid $12.85
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP :
334-1-134D [12.5) 2" SY $12.00 $12.00 $17.40 No Bid $11.55
Full Depth Reclamation (FDR and Cold-in-Place (CIP)
120-1A |Excavation for Widening or Unsutable Material CY $45.00 $50.00 $85.80 No Bid $40.25
905-324-3 |Cement- Cement Treatment TN $160.00 $117.50 $305.00 No Bid $197.70
905-324-4 |Asphaltic Emulsion- Emulsion Treated Base GAL $1.30 $1.45 $4.70 No Bid $3.00
Full Depth Reclamation(FDR) and Cold-in -Place (CIP)
Recycling from 0 to 2,500 Square Yards
905-324-1A |Pulverization (FDR) SY $3.70 $4.10 $7.10 No Bid $7.65
905-324-2A |Recycling Bituminous Paving (CIP) SY $4.90 $12.50 $21.40 No Bid No Bid
Full Depth Reclamation(FDR) and Cold-in -Place (CIP)
Recycling from 2,501 to 10,000 Square Yards
905-324-1B |Pulverization (FDR) SY $3.70 $4.10 $7.10 No Bid $3.40
905-324-2B |Recycling Bituminous Paving (CIP) SY $4.90 $12.50 $21.40 No Bid No Bid
Full Depth Reclamation(FDR) and Cold-in -Place (CIP)
Recycling from 10,001 to 25,000 Square Yards
905-324-1C |Pulverization (FDR) SY $3.70 $4.10 $7.10 No Bid $2.90
905-324-2C |Recycling Bituminous Paving (CIP) SY $4.90 $12.50 $21.40 No Bid No Bid
Full Depth Reclamation(FDR) and Cold-in -place (CIP)
Recycling from over 25,001 Square Yards
905-324-1D |Pulverization (FDR) SY $3.70 $4.10 $7.10 No Bid $2.55
905-324-2D |Recycling Bituminous Paving (CIP) SY $4.90 $12.50 $21.40 No Bid No Bid
GROUP-C Preservation/ Restoration
Pavement Preservation
335-3A Reclamite or Equivalent Pavement Rejuvenation SY No Bid No Bid $1.20 $0.87 $1.65
335-4A  |Fog Seal SY $0.50 $0.55 $0.70 No Bid $1.25
350-99A |Crack Sealing GAL $20.00 $22.25 $33.40 No Bid $25.30
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Micro- Surfacing

Asphalt Paving Systems

C.W. Roberts Contracting

OHL/ Community Asphalt

Pavement Technology,
Inc.

Ranger Construction
Industries, Inc.

917-335-1A |Single Application 0 to 15,000 Square Yards SY $1.90 $2.30 $3.40 No Bid $3.25

917-335-1B |Single Application over 15,001 Square Yards SY $1.90 $2.30 $3.40 No Bid $3.25

917-335-1C |Double Application 0 to 15,000 Square Yards SY $3.05 $3.90 $5.20 No Bid $4.55

917-335-1D |Double Application over 15,001 Square Yards SY $3.05 $3.90 $333.00 No Bid $4.55

917-335-1E |Rut Filling TN $0.10 $122.25 $3.70 No Bid $245.50

Chip Seal

917-335-2A |Signal Appication 0 to 15,000 Square Yards SY $2.30 $2.55 $3.70 No Bid $3.45

917-335-2B |Signal Appication over 15,001 Square Yards SY $2.30 $2.55 $3.70 No Bid $3.45

917-335-2C |Double Application 0 to 15,000 Square Yards SY $3.75 $4.20 $6.60 No Bid $5.55

917-335-2D |Double Applicatin over 15,001 Square Yards SY $3.75 $4.20 $16.60 No Bid $5.55
Variable Depths over 2" 0 to 15,000 Square .

01733596 [ards T g sy $3.78 $4.75 $13.00 No Bid $10.25
Variable Depths over 2" over 15,001 Square .

017-335-2F [vards " q SY $3.78 $4.75 $13.00 No Bid $10.25

Number of companies notified*:
Number of bid documents distributed:
Number of bids received

*per demandstar.com




