SCHEDULE "H" - CORE ITEMS UNIT PRICES

Agni Enterprises, LLC Safety Products, Inc. Ritz Safety
'LE:' e careoRy ITEM CLASS ITEM NUMBER OR EQUAL DESCRIPTION* um | ary D's:ﬂém D'spc':":"g:m TOTAL DISCOUNT RATE D'icgggzw TOTAL D's:zlém D'iﬁggﬂm TOTAL
1 |Fall Protection Fall Protection Accessories - FA 01214 GUARDIAN EXTERNAL SHOCK LANYARD, 3FT SINGLE LEG Each | 2 20% $ 61.49 $122.98 10% $29.12 $58.24 20% $25.88 $51.76
2 |Fall Protection Fall Protection Accessories - FA 01220 GUARDIAN EXTERNAL SHOCK LANYARD, 6FT SINGLE LEG fach | 5 A58 |8 ey $350.85 10% $46.38 $231.90 25% $38.65 $193.25
3 |WorkZone Traffic, Cones & Accessories - TCO 0350080KT REFL COLLAPSIBLE CONE WITHOUT LED LIGHT, 28", 5 PER PACK pack | 100 [ NOBID NOED NO BID 10% $13162 $13,162.00 30% $14122 $14,122.00
4 |work zone Traffic Signs,Cones - TC 038248 SAFETY CONE BAR ORANGE RETRACT Each | 120 0% % BB $3,567.60 20% $20.92 $2,51040|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
5 |Janitorial Janitorial, Paper Supplies - J4 08800016 HANDI-HOLD SPRAY BOTTLE, 16 OZ CLEAR 24/CS case | 2 0% | s 2877 $53.54 20% $28.05 $56.10]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
6 |First Aid First Aid, Ointment And Creams - OC 12900FA0 1602 IODINE BOTTLE MINIMUM ORDER OF 24 fach | 12 | NOBID po NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 |Gas Gas Detection Instruments - D1 18105841 REGULATOR UNF DEMAND-FLOW W/IGAS PRESSURE SWITCH DS2 fach | 1 Rl & 7645 $976.45 20% $565.80 $565.80|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
8 |Head Protection Head Protection, All Hardhats - H1 280CW420010SUNRISE__| HARD HAT WHITE 4200 SERIES 4PT SUS WHEEL RATCHET 4 COLOR LOGO gach | 12 | NO°° NOBI NOSID 20% $14.37 $172.44 30% $9.79 $117.48
9 |Head Protection Head Protection, All Hardhats - H1 280EV615139SUNRISE___| HARD HAT WHITE 4200 SERIES 4PT SUS WHEEL RATCHET 3 COLOR LOGO Each | S NOBID NOBID NOBID 20% $19.35 $96.75 30% $9.79 $48.95
10 _|Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic, Logoed Items - TLV 280FBWA20010SUNRISE _| 4200 SERIES FULL BRIM HARD HAT W/ WHEEL RATCHET 4 COLOR LOGO gach | 12 | NOBP NOBID NOBID 20% $14.37 $172.44 30% $9.79 $117.48
11_|Head Protection Head Protection, All Hardhats - H1 280HP241ROISUNRISE | CAP STYLE WHT DYNAMIC WHISTLER NV WHEEL RATCHET 3 COLOR LOGO gach | 10 | NOBP NOBID NOBID 20% $13.15 $131.50 30% $7.70 $77.00
12_|Head Protection Head Protection, All Hardhats - H1 280HPG41ROISUNRISE | FB STYLE WHT DYNAMIC KILIMANJA NV WHEEL RATCHET 3 COLOR LOGO gach | 10 | NOBP NOBiD NOBID 20% $14.60 $146.00 30% $9.79 $97.90
13 |First Aid Biohazard Products - F9 361005 NITRILE EXAM GLOVES LARGE 1PAIR PER BAG gach | 40 | NOBID MOED MOED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
14 |Fall Protection Fall Protection Accessories - FA 37017 GUARDIAN SERIES 15 PT HARNESS MED/LARGE Fach | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID 10% $50.12 $50.12 25% $41.77 $41.77
15_|Fall Protection Fall Protection, Harnesses - FB 37018 GUARDIAN SERIES 1 5 PT HARNESS XL/XXL Each | 1 MOED OED MOED 10% $52.09 $52.09 25% $43.41 $43.41
16_|Fall Protection Fall Protection, Harnesses - FB 37193 GUARDIAN SERIES 3 HARNESS W/ SIDE D-RINGS M-L Fach | 1 0% s Hezh $16133 10% $111.06 $111.06 25% $92.55 $92.55
17_|Fall Protection Fall Protection, Harnesses - FB 37194 GUARDIAN SERIES 3 HARNESS W/ SIDE D-RINGS, XL - 2XL fach | 1 R 4D $162.98 10% $113.02 $113.02 25% $94.19 $94.19
18 |Goods Covid-19 / Pandemic Items - CVD 3PLYMASK 3 PLY MASK NON-MEDICAL USE W/ EARLOOPS 50/BX - 40 BX/CS Box | 10 R 480 $46.00 0% $4.95 $49.50 25% $9.37 $93.70
19 |Gloves Gloves, Nitrile Reusable - G4 4028XL XL DURA-COR TOUCH EX GRADE PF LATEX 8MIL TEXTURE 100BX/10/CS case | 10 Gaall K 21155 $2,115.50 20% $14152 $1,41520  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20 |Fall Protection Fall Protection, Retractables - RL 42006 VELOCITY WEB SRL, 20 FT CARABINER INCLUDED Fach | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $396.70 $396.70|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
21 |Heat Stress Personal Cooling Products - CV 42127 CHILL-ITS 6487 COOLING BAND LIME gach | 75 | NOBID MOED MOED 20% $10.36 $777.00 25% $7.46 $559.50
22 |Heat stress Personal Cooling Products - CV 42129 CHILL-ITS 6487 COOLING MULTI- BAND, BLUE Each | 115 | NOBID NO BID NO BID 20% $10.36 $1,191.40 25% $7.46 $857.90
23 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB 4258BLACK GEMLINE BAG gach | 24 | NOBID MOED MOED 20% $13.10 $314.40 25% $11.99 $287.76
24 |Fall Protection Fall Protection, Harnesses - FB 47021 GARDIAN XPLORER HARNESS MED/LG Fach | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID 10% $334.15 $334.15 25% $278.46 $278.46
25 _|Fall Protection Fall Protection, Harnesses - FB 47022 GARDIAN XPLORER HARNESS XL/XXL Each | 4 MOED OED MOED 10% $339.07 $1,356.28 25% $282.56 $1,130.24
| 26 [safetysigns Tags,Placards Labels,Decals,Mi - $55 50503 8933 5050-3 BLK 2" GOTH QA 10/PK pack | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $7.39 $7.39 20% $6.31 $6.31
27 _|safety signs Tags,Placards,Labels,Decals,Mi - SS5 51400 B933 5140-0 BLK 4" GOTH QA 10/PK pack | 1 MOED OED MOED 20% $13.09 $13.09 20% $11.11 $11.11
28 |sanitorial Wall Dispensers & Misc. - k9 65037 HANDS FREE SANITIZER STATION Each | 3 NOED NOED MDED 20% $215.00 $645.00|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
29 _|Head Protection Head Protection, Accessories - H3 6650L CHILLITS HIGH PERFORMANCE HAT W/NECK SHADE LIME gach | 25 | NOBID OED MOED 20% $14.60 $365.00 25% $8.88 $222.00
30 |Confined Space Confined Space - €S 7150250 YELLOW SAFETY 5 GAL Fach | 3 NOBID NOBID NOBID 20% $144.98 $434.94 41% $92.55 $277.65
31 [Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - B1 7510115 57 15 STEEL TOE SERVUS BOOT GRAY/YELLOW/BLACK pair | 2 MOED OED MOED 20% $44.20 $83.40]  NOBID NO BID NOBID
32 y Miscellaneous - 2 76045000 RND PNT SHOVEL 12X8.75 BLADE 48 HNDL FIBERGLASS CSHN GRIP gach | as | NOPP NoBID NOBID 20% $38.29 $1,837.92|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
33 | Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS 78052X3X 2X/3X LADIES LIME W/ PINK VEST ANSI/ISEA 107-2015 Fach | 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $13.60 $27.20 20% $15.20 $30.40
34 _|Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS 78054X5X 4X/5X LADIES LIME W/ PINK VEST ANSI/ISEA 107-2015 fach | 2 MOED OED MOED 20% $13.60 $27.20 20% $15.20 $30.40
35 | Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS 7805LGXL LG/XL LADIES LIME W/ PINK VEST ANSI/ISEA 107-2015 Fach | 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $13.60 $108.80 20% $15.20 $121.60
36 _|Work Zone Traffic Signs,Cones - TC 7805SMMD SM/MD LADIES PINK VEST ANSI/ISEA 107-2015 fach | 8 MOED OED MOED 20% $13.60 $108.80 20% $15.20 $121.60
37 |Flame Safety Cabinets - CA 894530 CABINET 60 GALLON 2 DOOR SELF CLOSE 65X43X18 Fach | 1 NO BID NO BID NOBID 20% $1,741.98 $1,741.98 29% $1,874.19 $1,874.19
38 |Gloves Gloves, Cut Resistant - CT 9178NFOL L MEMPHIS KEVLAR 13G A4 HI-VIZ ORANGE NITRILE FOAM PALM DZ Dozen| 1 W |# 15533 $155.33 20% $13036 $13036 25% $70.50 $70.50
39 |Gloves Gloves, Cut Resistant - CT 9178NFOXL XLMEMPHIS KEVLAR 13G A4 HIVIZ ORANGE NITRILE FOAM PALM DZ Dozen| 1 il i 24889 $248.89 20% $13036 $13036 25% $70.50 $70.50
40_|Confined space Confined Space - CS 940301 ECONOMY UMBRELLA fach | 3 0% |3 SBeR $1,031.76 10% $209.72 $629.16]  NOBID NO BID NOBID
| 41 [safetysigns Tags,Placards,Labels,Decals,Mi - 555 99444 NFR VINYL SIGN KIT 15X15 INSTABILITY Each | 10 20% $ 100.34 $1,003.40 20% $45.99 $459.90 25% $47.18 $471.80
42_|spill Containment Sorbents, Spill Kits - A6 ASSPKIT20 OIL ONLY FLUID SPILL KIT 20 GAL IN YELLOW DRUM gach | 15 | NOBID OED MOED 20% $125.12 $1,876.80 35% $134.81 $2,022.15
43 |work zone Traffic, Stands - SS AFRAMESIGNSTAND PRODUCTION USE ONLY Each | 4 NO BID NO BID NOBID 20% $40.00 $160.00|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
44_|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - B1 813125106 52 6 STEEL TOE BLACK 15" PVC KNEE BOOT CLEATED OUTSOLE Pair | 5 A58 |8 &Y $116.00 20% $16.44 $82.20 35% $18.20 $91.00
45_|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - B1 B13125108 578 STEEL TOE BLACK 15" PVC KNEE BOOT CLEATED OUTSOLE Pair | 3 0% | $ 2y $67.20 20% $16.44 $49.32 35% $18.20 $54.60
46_|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - B1 813125110 57 10 STEEL TOE BLACK 15" PVC KNEE BOOT CLEATED OUTSOLE Pair | 3 A58 |8 2D $74.40 20% $16.44 $49.32 35% $18.20 $54.60
47_|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - B1 B13125111 57 11 STEEL TOE BLACK 15" PVC KNEE BOOT CLEATED OUTSOLE Pair | 3 0% | $ ZHD $82.80 20% $16.44 $49.32 35% $18.20 $54.60
48 _|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - B1 813125112 57 12 STEEL TOE BLACK 15" PVC KNEE BOOT CLEATED OUTSOLE ¢Pair | 3 R k8 $80.25 20% $16.44 $49.32 35% $18.20 $54.60




ITEM ITEM CLASS ITEM NUMBER OR EQUAL DESCRIPTION* um | qry | PISCOUNT | DISCOUNTED ToTAL DIscoUNTRaTE|  DISCOUNTED TOTAL DISCOUNT | DISCOUNTED TOTAL
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49 _|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - B1 B13125114 5214 STEEL TOE BLACK 15" PVC KNEE BOOT CLEATED OUTSOLE Pair | 3 0% % 2060 $74.40 20% $16.44 $49.32 35% $18.20 $54.60
50 |Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - B1 813126107 SZ 7 COMP SAFETY TOE BLACK CLEATED OUTSOLE HT 15" pair | 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $16.44 $32.88 35% $18.20 $36.40
51 |Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - BL 813126113 57 13 COMP SAFETY TOE BLACK CLEATED OUTSOLE HT 15" Pair | 3 MOED po MOED 20% $16.44 $49.32 35% $18.20 $54.60
NO BID NO BID NO BID
52_|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - BL B14325110 57:10 PULSAR BLACK/GRAY HT 15" COMPOSITE TOE CHEVRON PLUS Pair | 4 20% $38.88 $155.52 30% $29.54 $118.16
NO BID NO BID NO BID
53_|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - BL B14325111 57:11 PULSAR BLACK/GRAY HT 15" COMPOSITE TOE CHEVRON PLUS Pair | 4 20% $38.88 $155.52 30% $29.54 $118.16
) ) NO BID NO BID NO BID
54_|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - BL B14325112 57:12 PULSAR BLACK/GRAY HT 15" COMPOSITE TOE CHEVRON PLUS Pair | 4 20% $38.88 $155.52 30% $29.54 $118.16
NO BID NO BID NO BID
55_|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - B1 514325113 52:13 PULAR BLACK/GRAY HT 15" COMPOSITE TOE CHEVRON PLUS Pair | 3 20% $38.88 $116.64 30% $29.54 $88.62
) ) NO BID NO BID NO BID
56_|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - B1 81432519 52: 9 PULSAR BLACK/GRAY HT 15" COMPOSITE TOE CHEVRON PLUS Pair | 3 20% $38.88 $116.64 30% $29.54 $88.62
57 |Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - B1 17510110 57:10 STEEL TOE SERVUS BOOT GRAY/YELLOW/BLACK 6/CS pair | 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $46.16 $276.96|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
58 _|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - BL 817510111 57 11 STEEL TOE SERVUS BOOT GRAY/YELLOW/BLACK 6/CS pair | 4 MOED MOED MOED 20% $46.16 $184.64|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
59 |Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - B1 B17510112 57 12 STEEL TOE SERVUS BOOT GRAY/YELLOW/BLACK 6/CS pair | s NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $46.16 $230.80]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
60 _|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - BL 817510113 57:13 STEEL TOE SERVUS BOOT GRAY/YELLOW/BLACK 6/CS Pair | 3 MOED OED MOED 20% $46.16 $13848|  NOBID NO BID NOBID
61 |Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - B1 81751017 SZ 7 STEEL TOE SERVUS BOOT GRAY/YELLOW/BLACK 6/CS pair | 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $46.16 $92.32|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
62 _|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - BL 81751019 S 9 STEEL TOE SERVUS BOOT GRAY/YELLOW/BLACK 6/CS Pair | 1 MOED OED MOED 20% $46.16 $46.16|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
63 _|Foot Protection Boots, Steel Toe - BL B18968215 57:15 GREY SOLE KNEE HIGH 16" STEEL TOE BOOT, GOLIATH Pair | 6 0% | $ il $594.72 20% $46.16 $276.96|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
64_|Foot Protection Boots, Hip & Chest Waders - BS B5153108 SZ: 8 HIP BOOT 32" RUBBER STEEL SHANK STEEL TOE BLACK Pair | 3 0% |3 LR $331.14 20% $56.88 $17064 35% $51.87 $155.61
65 _|Foot Protection Boots, Hip & Chest Waders - BS B5153110 5Z: 10 HIP BOOT 32" RUBBER STEEL TOE STEEL SHANK BLACK Pair | 6 0% s L $662.28 20% $56.88 $341.28 35% $51.87 $31122
66_|Foot Protection Boots, Hip & Chest Waders - BS B5153111 SZ: 11 HIP BOOT 32" RUBBER STEEL SHANK STEEL TOE BLACK Pair | 8 0% |3 LR $883.04 20% $56.88 $455.04 35% $51.87 $414.96
67_|Foot Protection Boots, Hip & Chest Waders - BS B5153112 5Z:12 HIP BOOT 32" RUBBER STEEL SHANK STEEL TOE BLACK Pair | 6 0% s L $662.28 20% $56.88 $341.28 35% $51.87 $31122
68 _|Foot Protection Boots, Hip & Chest Waders - BS B5153113 52:13 HIP BOOT 32" RUBBER STEEL SHANK STEEL TOE BLACK Pair | 3 0% |3 LR $331.14 20% $56.88 $17064 35% $51.87 $155.61
69 _|Foot Protection Boots, Hip & Chest Waders - BS B5153114 SZ:14_HIP BOOT 32" RUBBER STEEL SHANK STEEL TOE RUBBER Pair | 2 0% |3 ho $220.76 20% $56.88 $113.76 35% $51.87 $103.74
70_|Foot Protection Boots, Hip & Chest Waders - BS B5153115 52:15 HIP BOOT 32" RUBBER STEEL SHANK STEEL TOE BLACK Pair | 2 0% |3 LR $220.76 20% $56.88 $113.76 35% $51.87 $103.74
71_|Foot Protection Boots, Hip & Chest Waders - BS B5153116 SZ:16 HIP BOOT 32" RUBBER STEEL SHANK STEEL TOE BLACK Pair | 6 0% s L $662.28 NO BID $56.88 $341.28 35% $51.59 $309.52
72 |safety signs Tags,Placards,Labels,Decals,Mi - $55 BPADDLEUSKIT INSPECTION STATUS INDICATOR W/ 2 WALLETS AND ZIP TIE gach | 10 | NOBID OED MOED 20% $7.55 $75.50]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
73 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB C112RICHNAVY PORT AUTHORITY SNAPBACK TRUCKER CAP RICH NAVY (SOLID) Each | 200 0% | % e $1,568.00 20% $4.05 $810.00]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
74 _|Hi-Viz Clothing Clothing, Ansi - AN €13531000LY2X3X 2X/3X VIZ, TYPE R CLASS 3 LIME TWO PIECE RAINSUIT, 30/CS fach | 1 MOED OED MOED 20% $43.00 $43.00 35% $25.32 $25.32
75_|Hi-Viz Clothing Clothing, Ansi- AN C1598RIH2XL 57 2XL LUMINATOR CLASS 3 GREEN BREATHABLE RAIN JACKET Each | 1 0% |3 e $122.32 20% $69.24 $69.24|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
76 _|Hi-Viz Clothing Clothing, Ansi - AN C1598RPW2XL 52 2XL, PANTS, RAINWEAR CLASS 3, BREATHABLE, LUMINATOR fach | 1 MOED OED MOED 20% $56.96 $56.96|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
77_|Hi-Viz Clothing Clothing, Ansi- AN C2RW30321Y2XL 52 2XL CLASS 3 GENERAL PURPOSE RAIN JACKET D-RING DETACH HOOD Each | 18 20% $53.04 $958.32 30% $37.80 $680.40
NO BID NO BID NO BID
78 | Hi-Viz Clothing Clothing, Ansi- AN C2RW303Z1Y3XL 52 3XL CLASS 3 GENERAL PURPOSE RAIN JACKET D-RING DETACH HOOD Each | 12 20% $53.24 $638.88 30% $37.80 $453.60
NO BID NO BID NO BID
79| Hi-Viz Clothing Clothing, Ansi- AN C2RW30321V4XL 4XL CLASS 3 GENERAL PURPOSE RAIN JACKET D-RING DETACH HOOD Each | 7 20% $66.50 $465.50 30% $37.80 $264.60
NO BID NO BID NO BID
80 |Hi-Viz Clothing Clothing, Ansi- AN C2RW30321YL 57 LRG CLASS 3 GENERAL PURPOSE RAIN JACKET D-RING DETACH HOOD Each | 29 20% $53.24 $1,543.96 30% $37.80 $1,096.20
NO BID NO BID NO BID
81 |Hi-Viz Clothing Clothing, Ansi- AN C2RW30321YM 2 MED CLASS 3 GENERAL PURPOSE RAIN JACKET D-RING DETACH HOOD Each | 19 20% $53.24 $1,011.56 30% $37.80 $718.20
NO BID NO BID NO BID
82 |Hi-Viz Clothing Clothing, Ansi- AN C2RW303Z1YXL SZ XL CLASS 3 GENERAL PURPOSE RAIN JACKET D-RING DETACH HOOD Each | 34 20% $53.24 $1,810.16 30% $37.80 $1,285.20
83 |Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS C3SP41EPGS3XAX SZ 3%/4X WEATHER PROOF CLASS E PANTS LIME Each | 11 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $20.64 $227.04 30% $14.87 $163.57
20% | 32.00
84 | Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS C35PA1EPGSML M/L CLASS E SEALED WATERPROOF LIME/BLACK BOTTOM PANTS Each | 32 $1,024.00 20% $20.64 $660.48 30% $14.87 $475.84
0% s 32.80
85 _|Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS C35PATEPGSXL2XL X/2X CLASS E SEALED WATERPROOF LIME/BLACK BOTTOM PANTS Each | 24 $787.20 20% $20.64 $495.36 30% $14.87 $356.88
NO BID NO BID NO BID
86 _|Hi-Viz Clothing Clothing, Ansi- AN Cca650C3s 52.SM CLASS 3 LIME RAIN COAT DETACH HOOD 2" RFL STRIPE Each | 1 20% $33.08 $33.08]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
0% | 234.80
87_|Disposable Clothing Clothing, Disposable - €5 C5TY120SWHAXL COVERALL WHITE ZIP FRONT 4XL OPEN WRT & ANK TYVEK 400 25/CS Case | 2 $469.60 20% $159.00 $318.00 25% $177.96 $355.92
20% | 232.96
88 | Disposable Clothing Clothing, Disposable - C5 CSTY120SWHSXL COVERALL WHITE ZIP FRONT 5XL OPEN WRT & ANK TYVEK 400 25/CS case | 2 $465.92 20% $171.44 $342.88 25% $192.15 $384.30
0% | 178.00
89 _|Disposable Clothing Clothing, Disposable - €5 C5TY120SWHLG COVERALL WHITE ZIP FRONT LG OPEN WRT & ANK TYVEK 400 25/CS Case | 1 $178.00 20% $131.08 $131.08 25% $146.67 $146.67
20% | 178.00
90_|isposable Clothing Clothing, Disposable - C5 CSTY120SWHXL COVERALL WHITE ZIP FRONT XL OPEN WRT & ANK TYVEK 400 25/CS case | 1 $178.00 20% $131.08 $131.08 25% $146.67 $146.67
NO BID NO BID NO BID
91_|Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB C871RTEDGE PRO CAMOUFLAGE SERIES GARMENT WASHED CAP REALTREE EDGE Each | 50 20% $5.35 $267.50|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% | 1046
92| Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB C925GREENCAMO PORT AUTH, GREEN CAMO CAP ONE SIZE Each | 30 $313.80 20% $5.35 $160.50|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
93 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB C925GREYCAMO PORT AUTH GRAYCAMO HAT ONE SIZE FITS ALL Each | 62 0% |8 s $648.52 20% $5.35 $33170|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
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ITEM ITEM CLASS ITEM NUMBER OR EQUAL DESCRIPTION* um | qry | PISCOUNT | DISCOUNTED ToTAL DIscoUNTRaTE|  DISCOUNTED TOTAL DISCOUNT | DISCOUNTED TOTAL
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20% |3 381
94_|Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB CP7SNAVY 6 PANEL UNSTRUCTURED COTTON CAP WITH VELCRO CLOSURE NAVY Each | 200 $762.00 20% $4.00 $800.00|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
95 _|safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - S51 cu170182 3X6 SIGN, VINYL, SUNRISE POLICE ARENA (LOGO) fach | 280 [ NOBID OED MOED 20% $1.25 $35000]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
96 _|Miscellaneous Misc. Items - M9 CU201950 2187 2 PLACARD 10.75X10.75" DOT ADHESIVE VINYL Fach | 3 NOBID NOED MO 20% $37.37 $112.11|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
97 _|Miscellaneous Misc. Items - M9 CU204891 CORROSIVE PLACARD, #1791 10.75 X 10.75 PS VINYL Each | 25 L ° 80 $21.25 20% $14.47 $36175|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
98 |safety Signs Tags,Placards Labels,Decals,Mi - 555 CU28789 10X14 PLASTIC USE STAIRWWAYS Each | 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $20.34 $203.40|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
99 _|Miscellaneous Misc. Items - M9 CU298607 CORROSIVE PLACARD, #1778 10.75 X 10.75 PS VINYL gach | 20 | NOBID po MOED 20% $17.26 $345.20]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
100 |[safety Signs Tags,Placards Labels,Decals,Mi - S55 CU387540 10X14 PLASTIC FIRE ACTION Each | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $20.34 $406.80]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
101 |safety Signs Tags,Placards,Labels,Decals,Mi - $55 CU387605 10X14 PLASTIC USE HANDRAIL gach | 10 | NOBID OED MOED 20% $20.34 $20340|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
102 |[safety Signs Tags,Placards,Labels,Decals,Mi - 555 CU387674 10X14 PLASTIC BE AWARE KNOW WHERE Each | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $20.34 $406.80]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
103 |Miscellaneous Misc. Items - M9 cu76927 CORROSIVE PLACARD, #1830 10.75 X 10.75 PS VINYL Each | 10 L ° D $13.00 20% $17.26 $17260|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
104 |Miscellaneous Misc. Items - M9 DL1478P CORROSIVE PLACARD, #1824 10.75 X 10.75 PS VINYL Each | 25 0% | % e $143.50 20% $2.42 $60.50]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
105 |Miscellaneous Misc. Items - M9 DL18SPR CORROSIVE PLACARD, #3266 10.75 X 10.75 PS VINYL Each | 20 R B $103.60 20% $2.18 $43.60]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
106 _|Miscellaneous Misc. Items - M9 DL718P 1005 2 PLACARD 10.75"X10.75" DOT ADHESIVE VINYL Each | 4 0% | % 28 $23.88 20% $2.18 $872|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
107 |Eye and Face Protection | Glasses - E1 E1200C SPI CLEAR LENS WRAPAROUND LENS W/ RUBBER TIP TEMPLES Pair | 100 R A5 $189.00 20% $136 $136.00 50% $199 $199.00
20% |3 7.54
108 |Eye and Face Protection | Glasses - E1 E128635 NEMESIS POLARIZED SMOKE LENS GUNMETAL COLOR FRME GLASS 12/B Pair | 12 $90.48 20% $21.96 $263.52 30% $18.89 $226.68
20% | $ 534
109 |Eye and Face Protection | Glasses - E1 E1300C SPI CLEAR LENS BLACK FRAME W/ CORD & SOFT TEMPLES Pair | 100 $534.00 20% $2.72 $272.00 50% $2.50 $250.00
20% |3 153
110 |Eye and Face Protection | Glasses - E1 ELEHF10S BULLDOG SCRATCH RESIST CLEAR LENS & FRAME GLASS 12/BX Pair | 250 $382.50 20% $0.96 $240.00 60% $0.80 $200.00
NO BID NO BID NO BID
111 [Eye and Face Protection | Glasses - E1 E1XB136 BRAZEAU DESIGNER SMOKE LENS BLACK NYLON FRAME TPR TEMPLES Pair | 74 20% $14.60 $1,08040|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
112 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB EMB12 1 LOCATION UP TO 4.25" 12 PC MIN EMBROIDERY CHARGE Fach | 12 20% $6.50 $78.00 30% $8.68 $104.16
NO BID NO BID NO BID
113 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB EMB24 1 LOCATION UP TO 4.25" 24 PC MIN EMBROIDERY CHARGE Each | 49 20% $4.50 $220.50 30% $8.68 $425.32
NO BID NO BID NO BID
114 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB EMBA48 1 LOCATION UP TO 4.25" 48 PC MIN EMBROIDERY CHARGE Each | 726 20% $3.50 $2,541.00 30% $8.68 $6,301.68
NO BID NO BID NO BID
115 |Work Zone Traffic, Strobes Lights - SA ET0010 ROADSIDE RECHARGEABLE FLASHER KIT, 4 WARNING LIGHTS PER KIT kit | 1 20% $203.80 $203.80|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
116 |First Aid Unitized First Aid - UN F112001 TRIPLE ANTIBIOTIC OINTMENT, 12/BOX nit | 1 0% | % 245 $2.43 20% $232 $232|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
117 [First Aid Miscellaneous, First Aid - MF F121004 4"X 5" INSTANT COLD COMPRESS SINGLE BOX (30 PER CASE) Each | 4 e ° o7s $2.96 20% $1.28 $512|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
118 |Goods Covid-19 / Pandemic Items - CVD F121022 BIOHAZARD BAG WITH TIE 20 GAL 24" X 24" 1 PER BOX Box | 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $2.88 $28.80]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
119 [First Aid Unitized First Aid - UN F121026 NITRILE EXAM GLOVES, EA=BX 4/BX Each | 2 L ° O $1.46 20% $3.32 $664|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
120 |First Aid Unitized First Aid - UN F17009 EVE KIT 1 OZ EYE WASH, 2 EYE PADS, 1/2" X 5 YARDS EYE TAPE Fach | 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $3.72 $7.44|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
121 [First Aid Unitized First Aid - UN F19001 AMMONIA INHALANTS, 10/8X Box | 2 L ° el $6.26 20% $4.24 $848|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
122 [First Aid Specialty First Aid Kits - SK F3930010P FIRST AID KIT CONTRACTORS 10 P PERSON PLASTIC Fach | 13 0% | $ o $208.26 20% $14.88 $193.44|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
123 [First Aid Specialty First Aid Kits - SK F4223AN ANSI COMPLIANT 25 PERSON FIRST AID KIT PLASTIC CASE Each | 6 0% % 2465 $149.16 20% $25.72 $154.32 25% $17.99 $107.94
124 |First Aid Bandages, Dressings And Tape - BA F45901 2"X5 YD. ELASTIC BANDAGE WRAP WITH 2 CLIPS Each | 20 0% |5 08 $15.60 20% $0.96 $19.20]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
125 [First Aid Dressings And Tape - BA F490890 2" TRIPLE CUT WATERPROOF FIRST AID TAPE Roll | 2 2 |8 267 $4.94 20% $2.28 $456]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
126 |First Aid First Aid Kit - FAK FAFA442 299 PIECE MEDIUM SOFTSIDED FIRST AID KIT ALL PURPOSE Each | S NOBID NOED MO 20% $21.08 $105.40|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
127 |First Aid First Aid Kit - FAK FAFAO130 ALL PURPOSE FIRST AID KIT 81 PC, PLASTIC CS MEDIUM gach | 200 [ NOBID MOED MOED 20% $9.56 $1,912.00 30% $10.49 $2,098.00
128 |First Aid Bandages, Dressings And Tape - BA F4G106 17X 3" PLASTIC BANDAIDS ADHESIVE 100 PER BOX Box | 4 0% |5 a5 $13.28 20% $3.52 $14.08]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
129 [First Aid Dressings And Tape - BA F4G122 1"X3" WOVEN BANDAGES 100/BOX Box | 4 R 2B $21.80 20% $5.04 $20.16]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
130 |First Aid Bandages, Dressings And Tape - BA F4G155 3/4"X3"PLASTIC BANDAGES ADHSV 100 PER BOX Box | 3 0% |5 28 $8.82 20% $3.04 $9.12|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
131 [First Aid Topical Skin Care - CE F4G310 PVP IODINE WIPES 50 PER BOX Box | 3 2 |8 WS $22.38 20% $6.96 $20.88]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
132 |[First Aid Topical Skin Care - CE F4G486 HYDROCORTISONE CREAM 1% 1GM 1/3207 PACKS 25/BOX Box | 5 0% | % g $20.70 20% $3.80 $19.00]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
. ! 20% | $ 446
133 |[First Aid Bandages, Dressings And Tape - BA FAH109 X-LARGE PASTIC BANDAGES ADHSV 2"X 4"ELBOW & KNEE 25/BOX Box | 3 $13.38 20% $4.32 $12.96|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
. ! 20% | $ 1.69
134 [First Aid Bandages, Dressings And Tape - BA FAH245 2"X4.1 YDS KLING NON STERILE 10 PER DISPENSER BOX 12BX/CS Box | 3 $5.07 20% $5.04 $15.12|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
. o 20% | $ 3.81
135 |First Aid Bulk First Aid Refills - F4 FAH305 ALCOHOL WIPES 100/BOX 1 TOWELETTE / PACKET Box | 2 $7.62 20% $3.72 $744]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
. o 20% | $ 458
136 |First Aid Topical Skin Care - CE FAH307 ANTISEPTIC WIPES 50 PER BOX Box | 4 $18.32 20% $4.40 $17.60| _ NOBID NO BID NO BID
. ! 0% |$ 1654
137 |[First Aid Bandages, Dressings And Tape - BA FAH638 1°X5 YDS ELASTIC TAPE SOLD BY BOX (10 ROLLS/BOX) Box | 1 $16.54 20% $14.08 $14.08]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
. ! o NO BID NO BID NO BID
138 |First Aid Miscellaneous, First Aid - MF FAM5056 4" SCISSORS FOR FIRST AID KITS ANGLED BLADE, RED HANDLE 12/CS Each | 1 20% $0.80 $080|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
139 |[First Aid Topical Skin Care - CE FAMS30 INSTANT COLD SPRAY 3 0Z CAN can | 1 R 2 $5.62 20% $5.60 $560]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
140 |[First Aid Miscellaneous, First Aid - MF FAMS64E COLD PACK REGULAR SIZE 6X9, BOXED 20/CASE Each | 24 0% |5 0E $21.12 20% $2.16 $51.84]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
141 |First Aid Miscellaneous, First Aid - MF FAMS8S DELUXE TWEEZERS STAINLESS STEEL 3.5" 1 EACH fach | 2 MOED OED MOED 20% $0.92 s1.84]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
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142 |First Aid Eye Care, First Aid - EC FAM701 TWIST TOP EYEWASH 4 OZ SOLD BY EACH 24/CS fach | 31 [ NOBID OED MOED 20% $4.00 $124.00]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
143 [First Aid Sun Care Products - SU F971666 SUNSCREEN LOTION 4 oz. BOTTLE SPF 30, WATER RESIS. 12/CS Bottle | 2 0% | % e $10.82 20% $3.48 $6.96 35% $24.80 $49.60
144 |First Aid Bulk First Aid Refills - F4 £980443 ISOPROPYL ALCOHOL 91% 1602 BOTTLE, 12/CASE Each | 24 0% % B $841.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
145 [First Aid Sun Care Products - SU F991663 SUNSCREEN LOTION FOIL PACK 50/PK, SPF 30 BROAD SPECTRUM Box | 7 20% $29.92 $209.44|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
146 |First Aid Topical Skin Care - CE F9B02CY HYDROGEN PEROXIDE 16 OZ BOTTLE 12/CASE Bottle | 7 0% |5 o $63.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
147 |First Aid First Aid Kit - FAK FIGOLFKIT PERSONAL FIRST AID KIT COMPLIMENTARY - 9214-SPI gach | so [ NOBID po MOED 20% $3.44 $172.00]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
148 |First Aid First Aid Kit - FAK FAO5499 36 UNIT FIRST AID KIT W/BBP AND CPR, METAL CASE Each | 9 0% |3 ) $966.51 20% $95.90 $863.10|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
149 |Work Zone Stop And Slow Paddles - SLP FSP192 18" LED STOP/SLOW PADDLE W/ 6" HANDLE Each | 6 0% % o $405.42 20% $273.40 $1,640.40 35% $24.25 $145.50
150 |Gloves Gloves, Leather Work - G1 61203 57 L LEATHER PALM WORK GLOVE CUFF BLUE AND RED STRIPE Dozen| 4 0% | $ oy $160.72 20% $26.00 $104.00|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% 4555
151 |Gloves Gloves, Leather Work - G1 G1203XL XL LEATHER PALM WORK GLOVE CUFF STRIPE BACK, 10 DZ/CASE Dozen| 4 $ $182.20 20% $28.04 $112.16]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
152 [Gloves Gloves, Leather Work - G1 G17200R2XL $2:2XL SPLIT LEATHER COWHIDE PALM GLOVE W/RUBBERIZED CUFF Dozen| 6 20% $31.24 $187.44|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
153 |Gloves Gloves, Latex & Vinyl Disp. - G5 G55049L LRG MEDTECH 11 MIL LATEX P/F MEDICAL GLOVES 50/BX Box | 190 0% | $ 20 $5,492.90 20% $11.36 $2,158.40 35% $15.91 $3,022.90
154 [Gloves Gloves, Latex & Vinyl Disp. - G5 G55049M MED MEDTECH 11 MIL LATEX P/F MEDICAL GLOVES 50/BX Box | 100 0% % 260 $2,891.00 20% $11.36 $1,136.00 35% $15.91 $1,591.00
155 |Gloves Gloves, Latex & Vinyl Disp. - G5 G55049XL XLMEDTECH 11 MIL LATEX P/F MEDICAL GLOVES 50/BX Box | 730 0% | $ 2891 | $31104.30 20% $11.36 $8,292.80 35% $15.91 $11,614.30
20% 5312
156 |Gloves Gloves, Nitrile Disposable - 612 G5601602XL 2XL NITRISHIELD ORANG NITR P/F GLOVE W/GRIPPAZ 6 MIL 100/BX Box | 1 o $53.12 20% $23.60 $23.60 35% $25.25 $25.25
157 |Gloves Gloves, Nitrile Disposable - G12 G560160L L NITRISHIELD ORANGE NITRILE GLOVE W/GRIPPAZ 6 MIL 100/BX Box | 10 0% % S $531.20 20% $23.60 $236.00 35% $24.70 $247.00
20% | 53.12
158 |Gloves Gloves, Nitrile Disposable - 612 G560160XL XL NITRISHIELD ORANGE NITRILE GLOVE W/GRIPPAZ 6 MIL 100/BX Box | 170 $9,030.40 20% $23.60 $4,012.00 35% $25.25 $4,292.50
20% | 31.84
159 [Gloves Gloves, Nitrile Disposable - G12 G58005PFL LRG N-DEX PLUS 8 MIL NO POWDER NITRILE UTILITY GLOVE 50/8X Box | 10 $318.40 20% $16.28 $162.80|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
160 |Gloves Gloves, Nitrile Disposable - 612 G58005PFXL XL N-DEX PLUS 8 MIL NO POWDER NITRILE UTILITY GLOVE 50/BX Box | 20 0% | $ s $636.80 20% $16.28 $32560|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
161 [Gloves Gloves, Latex & Vinyl Disp. - G5 G5SGNEPXLSTS XL8 MIL NITIRLE GLOVE PF BLUE 50/BX Box | 10 0% % BB $382.90 20% $30.36 $303.60|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
0% s 1112
162 |Gloves Gloves, Latex & Vinyl Disp. - G5 G5INDPS104 LRG SEMPERGUARD 4 MIL POWDERED LATEX IND GLOVES 100/BX Box | 1 $11.12 20% $6.28 $628]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
163 [Gloves Gloves, Nitrile Disposable - G12 GSINIPFT104 LRG 4 MIL NITRILE NO POWDER TEXTURE GRIP 9.5 LONG 100/BX Box | 40 0% % 16 $672.00 20% $11.60 $464.00]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
164 |Gloves Gloves, Nitrile Disposable - 612 GSINIPFT105 XL 4 MIL NITRILE NO POWDER TEXTURE GRIP 9.5 LONG 100/BOX Box | 30 0% | $ G $504.00 20% $11.36 $340.80|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
165 |Gloves Gloves, Nitrile Disposable - G12 G5SEC375L SZ:L NITRILE PF 14MIL 12" CUFF VIOLET BLUE 50/BX 10BX/CASE Box | 5 0% % i $83.60 20% $14.72 $73.60]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
166 |Gloves Gloves, Nitrile Disposable - 612 G5SEC375XL SZ:XL NITRILE PF 14MIL 12"CUFF VIOLET BLUE 50/BX 10/BX/CASE Box | 5 0% | $ iz $83.60 20% $14.72 $73.60| _ NOBID NO BID NO BID
0% s 16.72
167 |Gloves Gloves, Latex & Vinyl Disp. - G5 65563751 MICROFLEX LARGE LATEX GLOVES BLUE 50/BX/10BX/CS 11MIL/ 12" Box | 151 $2,524.72 20% $15.84 $2,391.84 37% $15.80 $2,385.80
0% s 16.72
168 |Gloves Gloves, Latex & Vinyl Disp. - G5 G55G375M MICRO FLEX MEDIUM LATEX GLOVES BLUE 50/BX/10BX/CS 11MIL/ 12" Box | 20 $334.40 20% $15.84 $316.80 37% $15.80 $316.00
0% s 16.72
169 |Gloves Gloves, Latex & Vinyl Disp. - G5 G55G375XL MICROFLEX XLARGE LATEX GLOVE BLUE 50/BX/10BX/CS 11MIL/ 12" Box | 161 $2,691.92 20% $15.84 $2,550.24 37% $15.80 $2,543.80
170 [Gloves Gloves, Coated Work - G6 6620761 57 L HELIX SERIES 13 GAUGE STEEL FIBERGLASS CUT AS Pair | 12 0% % o $120.60 20% $6.48 $77.76]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
171 |Gloves Gloves, Coated Work - G6 G62076XL 57 XL HELIX SERIES 13 GAUGE STEEL FIBERGLASS CUT AS Pair | 12 0% | $ Wi $120.60 20% $6.48 $77.76| __NOBID NO BID NO BID
172 [Gloves Gloves, Coated Work - G6 6639C122L L BLUE DIP LATEX SHELL PALM COATED GLOVE 25D2/CS Dozen| 25 0% % S0 $344.75 20% $7.88 $197.00]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
173 |Gloves Gloves, Coated Work - G6 G639C122XL XL BLUE DIP LATEX SHELL PALM COATED GLOVE 25DZ/CS Dozen| 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $7.96 $199.00]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
174 | Miscellaneous Gear Bags - GB GB3052 HIGH VISIBLITY YELLOW BACKPACK WITH REFLECTIVE STRIPING gach | 36 | NOBID OED MOED 20% $29.32 $1,05552|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
175 |Heat Stress Personal Cooling Products - CV 19396425KHKL L, EZ-COOL RANGER HAT KHAKI EXTENDED NECK SHADE 50/CS Each | 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $10.08 $100.80|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
176 |Heat Stress Personal Cooling Products - CV H98935CT HI-VIZ RANGER HAT WITH COOLING TOWEL INSERT, LIME L-XL gach | 24 | NOBID OED MOED 20% $13.64 $32736]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
177 |Goods Sg World Products - SGW HEKITPUS 5G WORLD USA STOCK HEAVY EQUIPMENT BOOKLET Each | 40 NOBID NOBID NOBID 20% $10.53 $421.20)  NOBID NO BID NO BID
178 |First Aid Topical Skin Care - CE HP3207 HYDROGEN PEROXIDE 32 OZ BOTTLE 3% 12/CASE Bottle | 52 2 |8 3 $173.16 20% $1.28 $66.56 30% $239 $124.28
NO BID NO BID NO BID
179 |Goods Covid-19 / Pandemic Items - CVD HS1GALCSA 4/CS HAND SANITIZER 1 GAL JUG 70% ALC ALOE GEL PUMP NOT INCL case | 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
180 y Miscellaneous - Z JBCRSI0055CTMBAFDOT _| 36" 12 LB CONE W/ RFL COLLARS & FDOT STENCIL QUOTEH GA286 Each | 600 20% $19.25 $11,550.00 43% $19.69 $11,814.00
181 |Work zone Traffic Signs,Cones - TC JBCSTENCIL STENCIL FOR CONES Each | 600 | NOBID NO BID NO BID 20% $0.84 $504.00 75% $0.15 $90.00
182 |Janitorial Hand Cleaner And Creams - K1 K9KCL1GSK KRESTO CLASSIC CLEANER 1 GALLON PUMP BOTTLE, 4/CS Case | 5 MOED OED MOED 20% $126.16 $630.80|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
183 [safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 LHTL116 HARD HAT STICKER - 2.25" 10/PK SAFETY IS MY GOAL pack | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $7.03 $7.03|  NoBID NO BID NO BID
184 |safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - S51 LHTL136 HARD HAT STICKER - 2.25" 10/PK MAKE TIME FOR SAFETY pack | 1 MOED OED MOED 20% $7.03 $7.03|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
) ! ) ) NO BID NO BID NO BID
185 [safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 LHTL152 HARD HAT STICKER - 2.25" SAFETY BEGINS WITH ME 10/PK Pack | 1 20% $7.03 $703]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
) ! ) ) NO BID NO BID NO BID
186 |[safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 LHTL171 HARD HAT STICKER - 2.25" 10/PK SAFETY BEGINS WITH TEAMWORK Pack | 1 20% $7.03 $703]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
) ! NO BID NO BID NO BID
187 [safety Signs Tags,Placards,Labels,Decals,Mi - 555 LHTL177 "SAFETY, ITS MY JOB, HARD HAT DECAL, 2.25™ DIA. 10/PK" Pack | 1 20% $7.03 $703|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
) ! 20% | $ 5.42
188 |[safety Signs Tags,Placards,Labels,Decals,Mi - 555 LHTL179 HARD HAT STICKER - 2.25" 10/PK SAFETY NEVER HURTS pack | 1 $5.42 20% $7.03 $703]  NoBID NO BID NO BID
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NO BID NO BID NO BID
189 [safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 LHTL189 HARD HAT STICKER - 2.25" 10/PK THE RIGHT WAY IS THE SAFE WAY Pack | 1 20% $7.03 $703|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
190 |safety Signs Tags Placards,Labels, Decals,Mi - 555 LHTL192 THE RIGHT WAY IS THE SAFE WAY DECAL, 2.25™ DIA. 10/PK" Pack | 1 20% $7.03 $7.03|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% 26.10
191 |[safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 LHTL196 HARD HAT STICKER - 2.25" THINK SAFETY Pack | 1 $26.10 20% $7.03 $703|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
192 |safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 LHTL308 HARD HAT STICKER - 2.25" 10/PK PRACTICE SAFETY AROUND THE CLO Pack | 1 20% $7.03 $7.03|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
193 |Work Zone Traffic, Safety Flares - SF M130FW 30 MINUTE FLARE W/WIRE STAND EMERGENCY FUSEE 36/CASE Case | 10 | NOBID MOED MOED 20% $99.84 $1,198.08]  NOBID NO BID NOBID
194 |[industrial Supplies Flashlights And Accessories - FL M2411063 12" LED MULTI FUNCTIONAL SIGNAL WAND 6/PK, 24/CS Each | 6 NO BID NOBID NO BID 20% $18.96 $113.76]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
195 |Lock Out Lockout Tagout Devices - L1 M25T0802 11/2" HASP WITH 6 HOLES FOR LOCKOUT/TAGOUT STEEL W/TAB gach | 24 | NOBID MOED MOED 20% $4.67 $112.08 30% $5.94 $142.56
196 |Heat Stress Personal Cooling Products - CV M9396602P E2-COOL NEON PINK PVA COOLING TOWEL Each | 10 NO BID NOBID NOBID 20% $5.28 $52.80 30% $5.56 $55.60
197 |Heat Stress Personal Cooling Products - CV M96602 BLUE CHILL-ITS COOLING TOWEL 13" X 29" TOWEL Each | 24 2% lza $290.64 20% $5.80 $139.20 30% $3.57 $85.68
198 |Heat Stress Personal Cooling Products - CV M9CT1005PI COLD SNAP COOLING TOWEL BLUE 33.5X13 IN_SPI LOGO Fach | 34 | NOBID MOED MO 20% $4.44 $150.96|  NOBID NOBID NO BID
199 |Heat Stress Personal Cooling Products - CV M9CT2005PI LIME COLD SNAP COOLING TOWEL 33.5X13 IN gach | 34 | NOBID MOED MOED 20% $4.44 $15096 30% $3.57 $12138
20% $15.47
200 |[safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 MELC138VP 10"X14" VINYL PLASTIC DANGER HIGH VOLTAGE AUTHORIZED PERSON Each | 2 $30.94 20% $11.70 $23.40|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
201 |Gloves Gloves, Latex & Vinyl Disp. - G5 MF300XL SZ XL DIAMOND GRIP PF LATEX GLOVE 100/BX/10/CS Case | 12 20% $211.55 $2,538.60 20% $180.00 $2,160.00]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
202 y Miscellaneous - 2 MISC. ITEM GRAVEX, CLEAR LENS BLACK FRAME fach | 12 | NOBID MOED MOED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
) ! ) ) ) NO BID NO BID NO BID
203 |[safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 MsK408 4 PC PRIDE IN SAFETY KIT -DIGI DAY SCOREBOARD,2 BANNER, 1POSTE kit | 4 20% $333.30 $1333.20]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
204 |Respiratory Moldex Disposable Respirator - MD R52200N95 MOLDEX DUST/MIST RESPIRATOR 2200-N95 20 PER BOX Box | 2 20% $34.40 $68.80 20% $23.52 $47.04 30% $20.90 $41.80
20% 4312
205 |Respiratory Moldex Disposable Respirator - MD R52300N95 MOLDEX DUST/MIST RESPIRATOR W/ EXHAL/VALVE 2300-N95 10/BOX Box | 10 3 $431.20 20% $23.60 $236.00 30% $25.61 $256.10
206 jratory Respiratory, Disposable - RS R58210 3M N95 PARTICULATE MASK 20EA/BX *NO OIL BASED Box | 6 2% EE $232.20 20% $20.48 $122.88 30% $16.13 $96.78
20% 44,58
207 y Respiratory, Disposable - RS RS8511 N 85 PART.MASK W/VALVE 10/BOX W/NOSE CLIP 3M *NO OIL BASED* Box | 32 ® $1,426.56 20% $23.80 $761.60 30% $19.17 $613.44
208 |Respiratory Respiratory, Half Face - R7 R7550030L HALF FACEPIECE LARGE LOW MAIN RESPIRATOR, NORTH 12/CS Each | 6 20% $21.60 $129.60 20% $13.52 $81.12 30% $12.29 $73.74
209 y North Half Mask - NH R7550030M HALF FACEPIECE MEDIUM LOW MAIN RESPIRATOR, NORTH 12/CS Each | 6 2% D $144.00 20% $13.52 $81.12 30% $12.29 $73.74
210 |Respiratory Respiratory, 3M Cartridges - 3C R76006 3M MULTI GAS/VAPOR CART. CARTRIDGE 2/PACK, 30/CS Pack | 12 20% $19.28 $23136 20% $14.88 $178.56 30% $10.84 $130.08
211 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB RCL12NAVY NAVY SOLID TRUCKER CAP MESH BACK Each | 7 MOED MOED MOED 20% $5.60 $39.20]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
212 [Eye and Face Protection __|Eyewear, Radians - RA RVO1POID REVELATION POLARIZED LENS BLACK FRAME GLASS 12/BX Pair | o8 20% $53.60 $5,252.80 20% $9.88 $968.24 30% $18.34 $1,797.32
20% $78.32
213 [Hi-viz Clothing Clothing, Ansi- AN RW30321Y5XL 52 5XL CLASS 3 GENERAL PURPOSE RAIN JACKET D-RING DETACH HOOD Each | 3 $234.96 20% $53.04 $159.72|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
N ) ) NO BID NO BID NO BID
214 [Hi-Viz Clothing Clothing, Ansi- AN RW30321Y5 52 M CLASS 3 GENERAL PURPOSE RAIN JACKET D-RING DETACH HOOD Each | 8 20% $53.24 $425.92|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
215 [Hi-Viz Clothing Clothing, Ansi- AN RW30ES1YM MED HI-VIZ GREEN CLASS E GENERAL PURPOSE RAIN BIB PANTS Fach | 2 NO BID NOBID NO BID 20% $34.24 $68.48|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
216 |Hearing Hearing, Earmuffs - 51 51Vs130 VERISHIELD 100 SERIES HEADBAND EARMUFF NRR 30 fach | 12 | NOBID MOED MOED 20% $22.48 $269.76 25% $22.49 $269.88
NO BID NO BID NO BID
217 |Hearing Hearing, Disposable Earplugs - $3 53150 SPI CORDED DISPOSABLE NRR 32 GREEN FOAM EARPLUG 100/BX Box | 1 20% $16.80 $16.80 30% $18.19 $18.19
NO BID NO BID NO BID
218 |Hearing Hearing, Disposable Earplugs - $3 S3MAX30 MAX ORANGE CORDED NRR 33 FOAM EAR PLUG 100/BOX 10BX/CS Box | 1 20% $26.56 $26.56]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
219 |Fall Protection Fall Protection, Harnesses - FB SBESOTE12XL 52:2XL CONSTRUCTION HARNESS W/ 3 D RINGS, T8 LEG / QT-3420066 Each | 1 20% $55.56 $55.56 30% $76.99 $76.99
NO BID NO BID NO BID
220 |Fall Protection Fall Protection, Harnesses - FB SBAB17560 UNIV 5-PT POSITIONING HARNESS 3 D-RINGS, TONGUE BUCKLES Each | 1 20% $55.56 $55.56|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
221 |Heat Stress Personal Cooling Products - CV SHAX6100 SHAX 6100 LIGHTWEIGHT INDUSTRIAL UMBRELLA Fach | 1 avs $155.82 $155.82 20% $111.96 $111.96|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
222 |[safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 SP124476L SAFETY POSTER: FORKLIFT SAFETY 17X22 LAMINATED Each | 1 2% FAED $50.96 20% $24.15 $24.15|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
223 |safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 SP124482L SAFETY POSTER: HOUSEKEEPING TIPS 17X22 LAMINATED Each | 1 A $50.96 $50.96 20% $24.15 $24.15|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $59.63
224 |safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 SP124505L SAFETY POSTER: OTHERS ARE COUNTING ONYOU 17X22 LAMINATED Each | 1 $59.63 20% $24.15 $24.15|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $50.96
225 |safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 SP124507L SAFETY POSTER:GO HOME SAFE TODAY17X22 LAMINATED Each | 1 $50.96 20% $24.15 $24.15|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $55.65
226 |safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 SP124508L SAFETY POSTER:GO HOME SAFE TODAY17X22 LAMINATED Each | 1 $55.65 20% $24.15 $2415|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $50.96
227 |safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 SP124511L SAFETY POSTER:PRIDE IN SAFETY 17X22 LAMINATED Each | 1 $50.96 20% $24.15 $24.15|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $57.30
228 |safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 SP124514L SAFETY POSTER:SAFETY IS A FAMILY VALUE 17X22 LAMINATED Each | 1 $57.30 20% $24.15 $24.15|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $60.21
229 |safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 SP124516L SAFETY POSTER: PRIDE OUR GOAL NO ACCIDENTS 17X22 LAMINATED Each | 1 $60.21 20% $24.15 $24.15|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $60.21
230 |[safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 SP124520L SAFETY POSTER: MAKE SAFETY A TEAM GOAL 17X22 LAMINATED Each | 1 $60.21 20% $24.15 $24.15|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
231 |safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 SP124521L SAFETY POSTER: WHO DEPENDS ON YOU 17X22 LAMINATED Each | 1 A $57.30 $57.30 20% $24.15 $24.15|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
232 |[safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 SP124522L SAFETY POSTER:SAFETY IS JOB # 1 17X22 LAMINATED Each | 1 2% il $54.21 20% $24.15 $24.15|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
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233 [safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 SP1245261 SAFETY POSTER:SAFETY IS A FAMILY VALUE 17X22 LAMINATED Each | 1 2% R $31.81 20% $24.15 $24.15|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
234 |safety Signs Safety Signs, Plastic & Alumin - 551 SP124889L SAFETY POSTER: 65 LEAN WORKPLACE 17X22 LAMINATED Each | 1 A $83.15 $83.15 20% $24.15 $24.15|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
— ) ) 20% $62.32
235 | Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS SPATEPGSSX6X 5X6X SEALED WATERPROOF CLASS E PANTS LIME W/ SILVER STP BLK Fach | 3 $186.96 20% $18.40 5520 NOBID NO BID NO BID
N 20% $13.12
236 | Work Zone Traffic,Barricade Tapes - BTS $521000CE CAUTION-DO NOT ENTER 2 MIL 3X1000 YELLOW/BLACK TAPE Roll | 96 $1,259.52 20% $6.80 $652.80 50% $6.49 $623.04
o NO BID NO BID NO BID
237 |Work Zone Traffic,Barricade Tapes - BTS $531000CC CAUTION/CAUTION TAPE 2.5 MIL 3X1000 BLACK/YELLOW NO LOGO Roll | 0 20% $9.32 $0.00 50% $6.49 $0.00
o NO BID NO BID NO BID
238 |Work Zone Traffic,Barricade Tapes - BTS $531000PL POLICE LINE DO NOT CROSS 2.5 MIL 3X1000 YELLOW/BLACK TAPE Roll | 30 20% $10.72 $321.60 50% $7.95 $238.50
20% $17.47
239 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB ST340LSNYELLOW2XL | SPORT TEK POSI CHARGE LONG SLEEVE TSHIRT 2XL NEON YELLOW Fach | 11 $192.17 20% $9.25 $101.75|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $22.82
240 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB ST340LSNYELLOW3XL | SPORT TEK POSI CHARGE LONG SLEEVE TSHIRT 3XL NEON YELLOW Each | 1 $22.82 20% $11.25 $11.25|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $22.82
241 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB ST340LSNYELLOWAXL | SPORT TEK POSI CHARGE LONG SLEEVE TSHIRT 4XL NEON YELLOW Each | 2 $45.64 20% $12.25 $24.50]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $17.47
242 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB ST340LSNYELLOWL SPORT TEK POSI CHARGE LONG SLEEVE TSHIRT NEON YELLOW L Fach | 11 $192.17 20% $8.25 $90.75|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $17.47
243 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB ST340LSNYELLOWM SPORT TEK POSI CHARGE LONG SLEEVE TSHIRT NEON YELLOW M Each | 8 $139.76 20% $8.25 $66.00]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $22.82
244 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB ST340LSNYELLOWS SPORT TEK POSI CHARGE LONG SLEEVE TSHIRT NEON YELLOW S Fach | 3 $68.46 20% $8.25 $24.75|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $17.47
245 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB ST340LSNYELLOWXL SPORT TEK POSI CHARGE LONG SLEEVE TSHIRT NEON YELLOW XL Each | 16 $279.52 20% $8.25 $132.00]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
246 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB ST340LSTROYALM SPORT TEK POSI CHARGE LONG SLEEVE TSHIRT TRUE ROYAL M Fach | 3 20% $8.25 $24.75|  NoBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
247 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB ST340LSTROYALXL SPORT TEK POSI CHARGE LONG SLEEVE TSHIRT TRUE ROVAL XL Fach | 3 20% $8.25 $24.75|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $26.80
248 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB ST340NYELLOWM SPORT TEK POSI CHARGE SHORT SLEEVE TSHIRT NEON YELLOW M Fach | 3 $80.40 20% $8.25 $24.75|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
20% $12.17
249 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB ST340TROYALXL SPORT TEK POSI CHARGE SHORT SLEEVE TSHIRT TRUE ROVAL XL Fach | 3 $36.51 20% $8.25 $24.75|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
250 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB ST3SONYELLOWXL SPORT TEK COMPETITOR TSHIRT NEON YELLOW XL Each | 3 2% PG $46.86 20% $8.25 $24.75|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
251 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB STCIZNAVYLXL SPORT TEK FLEX FIT PERFORMANCE SOLID CAP NAVY L/XL Each | 24 20% $1041 $249.84 20% $8.68 $20832|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
252 |Apparel Corporate Apparel Sales - EMB STCI7NAVYSM SPORT TEK FLEX FIT PERFORMANCE SOLID CAP NAVY SM/MED Each | 12 2% e $124.92 20% $8.68 $104.16)  NOBID NO BID NO BID
253 |Heat Stress Personal Cooling Products - CV SUNHAT REFLECTIVE SUNHAT Fach | 25 avs $14.48 $362.00 20% $9.60 $240.00 35% $7.80 $195.00
) ) NO BID NO BID NO BID .,
254 |safety Signs Tags,Placards,Labels,Decals,Mi - 555 SUNRISELANYARD 20MM CUSTOM SUNRISE LANYARD Each | 200 20% $5.95 $1,190.00 30% $251 $502.00
255 | Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS SVBHGAXL 4XL CLASS 2 LIME VEST HVY DUTY TWO TONE SURVEYOR ZIPPER CLOS Each | 2 A $19.49 $38.98 20% $17.96 $35.92|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
256 |Work Zone Safety Flags - FLS TC1824M 18X18 ORG MESH FLAG W/ 24" WOOD DOWEL fach | 8 2% e $94.72 20% $2.48 $19.84 25% $5.92 $47.36
257 | Work Zone Safety Flags - FLS TC1824V 18X18 ORG VINYL FLAG W/ 24" WOOD DOWEL Each | 24 20% $1093 $262.32 20% $2.40 $57.60 25% $3.62 $86.88
20% $66.87
258 |Work Zone Roadway Paint And Markings - MPA TC203031 RUSTOLEUM CAUTION BLUE, 1702 INDUSTCHOICE,WATER-BASED 12/CS case | 1 $66.87 20% $46.48 $46.48 35% $33.07 $33.07
20% $80.72
259 |Work Zone Roadway Paint And Markings - MPA TC203032 RUSTOLEUM FLO-GREEN WATER BASE UPSIDE DOWN MARKING PAINT Case | 1 $80.72 20% $46.48 $46.48 20% $35.99 $35.99
20% $73.31
260 |Work Zone Roadway Paint And Markings - MPA TC203039 RUSTOLEUM WHITE WATER BASE 17 0Z MARKING PAINT 12/CS case | 1 $73.31 20% $46.48 $46.48 35% $33.07 $33.07
20% $17.85
261 |Heat Stress Personal Cooling Products - CV TC350RANGER RANGER HI-VIS FULL BRIM YELLOW HAT , ANSI FABRIC, 50/CS Each | 24 $428.40 20% $4.32 $103.68 30% $10.39 $249.36
20% $67.47
262 |Work Zone Traffic, Cones & Accessories - TCO TC36REL 36" 12 LB ORANGE TRAFFIC CONE W/ RFL COLLARS FDOT CERT 198/P Each | 230 $15,518.10 20% $22.27 $5,122.10 3% $19.69 $4,528.70
263 |Work Zone Traffic Control Manufactured - TCM TC44008HIZ 1" X 8" X 8' RAIL HI 2 SIDES SHEETED FOR P-CADE OR A-CADE Fach | 8 NOBID NOED MO 20% $41.28 $330.24|  NOBID NO BID NO BID
264 |Hi-viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCa50G2XL 2XL TYPE R CLASS 2 GREEN MESH TWO-TONE VEST, ZIPPER Each | 26 2% FEIE $992.16 20% $6.60 $171.60 25% $8.25 $214.50
265 | Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TC450G3XL 3XLTYPE R CLASS 2 GREEN MESH TWO-TONE VEST, ZIPPER Each | 6 A $18.54 $111.24 20% $5.60 $33.60 25% $8.25 $49.50
266 _|Hi-viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCA50GAXL 4XLTYPE R CLASS 2 GREEN MESH TWO-TONE VEST, ZIPPER Each | 2 2% L $04.84 20% $5.60 $11.20 25% $8.25 $16.50
267 |Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TC450G5XL 5XLTYPE R CLASS 2 GREEN MESH TWO-TONE VEST, ZIPPER Each | 1 A $19.60 $19.60 20% $5.60 $5.60 25% $8.25 $8.25
268 |Hi-viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCa506L LRG TYPE R CLASS 2 GREEN MESH TWO-TONE VEST, ZIPPER Each | 46 2% e $011.72 20% $5.60 $257.60 25% $8.25 $379.50
269 |Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TC4506M MED TYPE R CLASS 2 GREEN MESH TWO-TONE VEST, ZIPPER Each | 29 A $18.54 $537.66 20% $5.60 $162.40 25% $8.25 $239.25
270 _[Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCA50GXL XLTYPE R CLASS 2 GREEN MESH TWO-TONE VEST, ZIPPER Each | 58 2% iy $1,136.80 20% $5.60 $324.80 25% $8.25 $478.50
271 |Work Zone 48" Mesh Signs/Overlays - M48 TC48X4814 UTILITY WORK AHEAD 48" MESH W/VINYL POCKETS Each | 4 avs $133.90 $535.60 20% $30.32 $121.28 25% $44.04 $176.96
272 |Work Zone Traffic, Reflective Aluminum - RAS TCALUMSIGN ALUMINUM SIGN Each | 6 MOED OED MOED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
273 |Work Zone Traffic, Cones & Accessories - TCO TCCONEBARIOWO CONE BAR EXTENDS 6-10.5 FT WHITE AND ORANGE Fach | 92 20% $36.09 $3,32028 20% $24.12 $2,19.04 30% $27.99 $2,575.08
274 |Work Zone Traffic, Sign Accessories - RSA TCFFS2 FOLDING FLAG ASSEMBLY HOLDS 2 FLAGS Each | 4 MOED OED MOED 20% $16.04 $64.16|  NOBID NO BID NOBID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
275 |Work Zone Traffic, Barricades & Drums - BAR TCPCADELEG P-CADE WHITE PLASTIC LEG ONLY FOR ADA PEDESTRIAN BARRICADE Each | 4 20% $16.12 $64.48]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
276 | Work Zone Traffic Signs,Cones - TC TCPRGAA TRAFFIC CONTROL POCKET REF. BASED ON MUTCD 80 PAGES Each | 204 20% $11.92 $2,431.68 30% $9.76 $1,991.04
NO BID NO BID NO BID
277_|Work Zone Traffic Control Manufactured - TCM TCRASHD HEAVY-DUTY RIBS FOR 48" SIGN Set | 4 20% $10.76 $43.04]  NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
278 |Work Zone Traffic, Stands - 55 TCSPI2000 SIGN STAND W/COMPACT SINGLE COIL SPRING W/SCREW ATTACHMENT Each | 4 20% $125.48 $501.92 30% $12239 $489.56
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279 |Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCSV272ZGM2XL 2XL CLASS 2 LIME MULTIPURPOSE SURVEYOR MESH VEST W/ ZIPPER Each 28 $361.48 20% $5.64 $157.92 25% $6.42 $179.76
20% $12.91

280 |Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCSV272ZGM3XL 3XL CLASS 2 LIME MULTIPURPOSE SURVEYOR MESH VEST W/ ZIPPER Each 2 $25.82 20% $5.64 $11.28 25% $6.42 $12.84
20% $10.99

281 |Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCSV272ZGMAXL 4XL CLASS 2 LIME MULTIPURPOSE SURVEYOR MESH VEST W/ ZIPPER Each 2 $21.98 20% $5.64 $11.28 25% $6.42 $12.84
20% $10.99

282 |Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCSV272ZGML LRG CLASS 2 LIME MULTIPURPOSE SURVEYOR MESH VEST W/ ZIPPER Each 20 $219.80 20% $5.64 $112.80 25% $6.42 $128.40
20% $10.99

283 |Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCSV272ZGMM MED CLASS 2 LIME MULTIPURPOSE SURVEYOR MESH VEST W/ ZIPPER Each 4 $43.96 20% $5.64 $22.56 25% $6.42 $25.68
20% $10.99

284 |Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCSV272ZGMXL XL CLASS 2 LIME MULTIPURPOSE SURVEYOR MESH VEST W/ ZIPPER Each 52 $571.48 20% $5.64 $293.28 25% $6.42 $333.84
20% $10.99

285 |Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCSVEHG3XL 3XL CLASS 2 LIMEE VEST HVY DUTY TWO TONE SURVEYOR ZIPPER CLOS Each | 2 $21.98 20% $17.96 $35.92 30% $13.21 $26.42
20% $13.42

286 |Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCSVEHGL LG CLASS 2 LIME VEST HVY DUTY TWO TONE SURVEYOR ZIPPER CLOS Each 1 $13.42 20% $17.96 $17.96 30% $13.21 $13.21
20% $11.74

287_|Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCSVEHGM MED CLASS 2 LIME VEST HVY DUTY TWO TONE SURVEYOR ZIPPER CLOS Each | 1 $11.74 20% $17.96 $17.96 30% $13.21 $13.21
20% $13.86

288 |Hi-Viz Clothing Traffic Vests, Shirts & Pants - AVS TCSVE6HGXL XL CLASS 2 LIME VEST HVY DUTY TWO TONE SURVEYOR ZIPPER CLOS Each 13 $180.18 20% $17.96 $233.48 30% $13.21 $171.73

289 |Heat Stress Personal Cooling Products - CV V529108L 10X10 VISTA INSTANT SHELTER BLUE, WITH CARRY BAG Each | 1 20% LEL30 $187.36 20% $201.66 $201.66|  NOBID NO BID NO BID

290 |safety Signs Floor Signs - FLR WFS71TX WALK ON TEX WALK "PLEASE PRACTICE SOCIAL DISTANCING" Each 12 avs $21.21 $254.52 20% $16.88 $202.56 30% $19.25 $231.00
20% $212.08

291 |Safety Signs Floor Signs - FLR WFS74A REMOVEABLE NONSLIP VINYL"PLEAS PRACTICE...DISTANCING (FEET)" Each 12 $2,544.96 20% $15.32 $183.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID

292 |Eye and Face Protection | Glasses - E1 XD416VS DAWSON MATT BLACK SMOKE VAPOR SHIELD LENS Pair | 50 2% HEED $2,080.00 20% $19.99 $999.50| NOBID NO BID NOBID

GRAND TOTAL VENDOR NAME $120,360.95 $127,501.79 $99,409.75
BALANCE OF LINE PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT 20% 20% 15-20%

* Equal/substitute products are allowed.

** Price di:

from current

The City will consider item by item bids.

SCHEDULE “H” - CORE ITEMS

UNIT PRICES — CORE ITEMS

catalog. Percentage discount per Schedule A. Quantities and items in Schedule H are for informational purposes and does not define citywide annual orders.
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